
39' Timber Ketch
General Specs

Length 11.90 m

Beam 3.25 m

Draft 1.75 m

Year 1967

Location Sydney, NSW

Price $ 87,000

‘Sana’ is a beautiful sight to see on Sydney
Harbour. I’ve admired her many times while
out sailing on my little Bluebird or racing
across the harbour in the work tender. She
always seems to be under full sail, which must
be an indication of how easy to rig the topsail
must be. The wishbone rig allows for easy
tacking and easy reefing and as soon as a sail
gets hard to handle, you simply drop it and
carry on with the others. ‘Sana’ is a welcome
regular at the Sydney Amateur’s biennial
‘Gaffers Day’. Her graceful lines and 4 sail rig
lend her the presence and romanticism of an
18th century tall ship. Beautiful teak decks,
bronze portholes and chrome dorades
complete the picture. Down below is sparse by
modern standards but welcoming and bright
with white bulkheads and blonde timbers. This
lovely classic is fast inshore and offshore, while
easy to handle and comfortable to cruise.
Well-presented and very well maintained, this
is your opportunity to own a beautiful classic
boat.
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